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A New York Times Notable Book of the Year.

Shortlisted for the 2016 Man Booker Prize, Hot Milk moves "gracefully among pathos, danger, and
humor” (The New York Times).

I have been sleuthing my mother's symptoms for as long as I can remember. If I see myself as an unwilling
detective with a desire for justice, is her illness an unsolved crime? If so, who is the villain and who is the
victim?

Sofia, a young anthropologist, has spent much of her life trying to solve the mystery of her mother's
unexplainable illness. She is frustrated with Rose and her constant complaints, but utterly relieved to be
called to abandon her own disappointing fledgling adult life. She and her mother travel to the searing, arid
coast of southern Spain to see a famous consultant--their very last chance--in the hope that he might cure her
unpredictable limb paralysis.

But Dr. Gomez has strange methods that seem to have little to do with physical medicine, and as the
treatment progresses, Sofia's mother's illness becomes increasingly baffling. Sofia's role as detective--
tracking her mother's symptoms in an attempt to find the secret motivation for her pain--deepens as she
discovers her own desires in this transient desert community.

Hot Milk is a profound exploration of the sting of sexuality, of unspoken female rage, of myth and
modernity, the lure of hypochondria and big pharma, and, above all, the value of experimenting with life; of
being curious, bewildered, and vitally alive to the world.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Grubb:

The book Hot Milk can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you
want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book Hot Milk? A number of you have a different opinion
about publication. But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try
to closer with the book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you
could share all of these. Book Hot Milk has simple shape but you know: it has great and large function for
you. You can appear the enormous world by open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Alan Robert:

The ability that you get from Hot Milk may be the more deep you digging the information that hide inside
the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but
Hot Milk giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in a number of way
that can be understood through anyone who read this because the author of this e-book is well-known
enough. This book also makes your vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go
together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having that Hot Milk
instantly.

Eric Bittinger:

Many people spending their period by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just watching
TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book. Ugh, ya think
reading a book really can hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It okay you can have the e-
book, taking everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Hot Milk which is keeping the e-book
version. So , try out this book? Let's view.

Sue Joseph:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source that filled update of news. In this
modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media social
similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just seeking
the Hot Milk when you needed it?
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